
1

  Best paper award for UCy professors
Media: Cyprus Mail Page: 14 Published at: 04-02-2020

Author: Surface: 77.47 cm²

Subjects: UCY, UCY ONLY

Best paper award for UCy
TWO faculty members of the 
University of Cyprus have won 
the 2019 Best Paper Award of 
the international journal IEEE 
Signal Processing Letters for 
their paper titled Fairness for 
Non-Orthogonal Multiple Ac­
cess in 5G Systems.
The authors of the awarded 
paper, assistant professor Ste-

lios Timotheou and associate 
professor Ioannis Krikidis are 
faculty members of the depart­
ment of electrical and comput­
er engineering of the University 
of Cyprus, and also faculty 
members of the Kios Research 
and Innovation Centre of Excel­
lence and the Irida Research 
Centre for Communication

professors
Technologies, respectively. The 
research presented in the paper 
was partially funded by the Re­
search and Innovation Founda­
tion of Cyprus.

■ The paper can be viewed here: 
https:/,lieeexplore.ieee.org/docu- 
ment/7069272
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